County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

Buyers
Karin Dorr

Amanda McCracken

Director
Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Email Addresses:
marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore

Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

APRIL 24, 2023

NOTICE OF AWARD

MR PATRICK O’BRYAN MS CYNTHIA CARROLL
BARRETT PAVING MATERIALS INC  GRAROCK LLC

26572 NYS RT 37 10423 STODDARD ROAD
WATERTOWN NY 13601 COPENHAGEN NY 13626

MR JOHN VESPA, PRESIDENT
ARSENAL STONE

VESPA SAND & STONE

19626 OVERLOOK DRIVE
WATERTOWN NY 13601

MS. LISA K MEEKS
MEEKS TRUCKING & PLOWING

MR WILLIAM KING, VP MS. JODI DELLES
R.G. KING GENERAL CONSTRUCTION, INC. HEIDELBERG MATERIALS

13018 COUNTY ROUTE 155 NORTHEAST NY 28218 COUNTY ROUTE 32

ADAMS CENTER NY 13606 PO BOX 130 EVANS MILLS NY 13637
WATERTOWN NY 13601

BID #2023H-1 NAME: STONE, SAND, GRAVEL & TOPSOIL

AWARD: BASED ON LOW BID, ON CLOSEST LOCATION & HAUL FACTOR TO EACH PROJECT
CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1, 2023 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025
Dear Mr. Vespa, Mr. O’Bryan, Ms. Carroll, Mr. King, Ms. Delles, Ms. Meeks:

| am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full
compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are enclosed or pending:
\ Purchase Order to be issued
If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

—YY o .
/ ﬁikigal YAC o

Mark-Sachetti, Purchasing Directar
MS/kd

C:  Department, Auditor, Bid File

SHARED/BIDS/HIGHWAY BID BOOK 2023-2025/AWARD HIGHWAY 2023H-1



BID #2023H-1

STONE, SAND, GRAVEL AND TOPSOIL, UNCLASSIFIED SELECT FILL

BID TABULATION

ARSENAL BARRETT VESPA SAND &
SAND & PAVING HEIDELBURG STONE MEEKS
STONE MATERIALS, |GRAROCK LLC| MATERIALS OVERLOOK TRUCKING R.G. KING
OLD ROME INC. DRIVE
STATE WATERTOWN QUARRY
LOADED LOADED LOADED LOADED LOADED SUXER LOADED TO LOAD
ITEM LOADED
SuB PROJECT (TON) (TON) (TON) (TON) (TON) @) (TON) (cv)
Bidder shall advise as to the NYS DOT
type of APPROVED SCREENED
IMESTONE LIMESTONE [ SAND/GRAVEL
material Proposed to be HIMESTONE HIMESTONE | UNSRECIRED CRUSHED . TOPSOIL / f
furnished. LIMESTONE
$8.50
Subgrade A doss/
203.201 ubgravesirea $8.75 $9.00 $3.00 $10.00 $8.75 NO BID NOBID | Williams Pit/
Material
Lyndaker 122
Pits
8.50
203.05/203.06 SRES AR $8 $9.00 $3.2 $10.00 $8.75 NO BID NO BID Joss
BiBSARG: & Select Fill 73 % 835 ) ’ Lyndaker 122
Pits
8.5
Select Granular Jossi}
203.07/203.21 Fill & Select' $8.75 $9.00 NO BID $10.00 $8.75 NO BID NO BID | yrdaker 12z
Structure Fill :
Pits
Select Granular
. A § 4 5 2 NO BID NO BID 8.50
203.20 subgrade $9.25 $9.00 $7.00 $10.00 $9.25 $8.5
203.01 Shotrock $8.75 $9.00 $8.00 $10.00 $8.75 NO BID $8.50 NO BID
620.03 Light Stone Fill $14.00 $14.20 $11.50 $18.00 $14.00 NO BID $13.50 NO BID
620.04 ’;?Ifd'”m stone | Vo BID §15.50 §13.00 $18.25 NO BID NO BID §15.50 NO BID
Heavy Stone
620.05 (a) (F;\]llon NO BID $20.00 $14.00 $20.50 NO BID NO BID $16.00 NO BID
Staackable)
Heavy Stone
620.05 (b) Fill NO BID $30.00 NO BID $26.00 NO BID NO BID $27.75 NO BID
(Staackable)
Screened $25.00 (CY)
. . i . 0.00 NO BID
613.01 Topsoil $30.00 NO BID $24.00 NO BID $30.00 PICKEDUP $3
Stripped
613.02 Topsoil $22.00 NO BID $14.00 NO BID $22.00 NO BID $18.50 NO BID
(unscreened)
- | — - -
COMMENTS: ] -
ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING, | o o
SUBJECT TO ERRO‘BS OR OMISSIONS. THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION
OF BID RESULTS kaLESS‘S'lGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
THIS BID TABUJ!ATION DOES NOT IMPLY AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED.
j_" ‘,,-") e ————
/ 3/16/2023 . -
PURCHASING DEPT . DATE




BID #2023H-1
STONE, SAND, GRAVEL AND TOPSOIL, CRUSHED STONE GRAVEL
BID TABULATION

PART Il CRUSHED STONE & GRAVEL

2023 - 2025 BID PRICING

ARSENAL SAND BARRETT VESPA SAND & R G KING
HEIDELBURG
& STONE PAVING STONE GENERAL
GRAROCK LLC MATERIALS
OLD ROME MATERIALS, INC. OVERLOOK CONSTRUCTION
STATE WATERTOWN DRIVE QUARRY INC
ITEM DESCRIPTION
NYS DOT
Bidder shall advise as to the type of APPROVED
u ified
material proposed to be furnished: LIMESTONE LIMESTONE nspecifie CRUSHED LIMESTONE LIMESTONE
LIMESTONE
I
Crushed Limestone or Stone Dust $15.00 $15.00 NO BID $17.50 $15.00 $14.50
h .
GradediCrushed  |op  in $16.00 $14.25 $12.00 $18.90 $16.00 $14.50
Stone:
Size 1B NO BID $15.75 $14.00 $18.30 NO BID $13.25
Size 1ST NO BID $15.00 $11.00 $18.60 NO BID $14.50
Size10r2 $15.00 $13.50 $11.00 $16.80 _$15.00 $13.50
Size 1 & 2 Blend $16.00 $14.00 $11.00 $16.80 $16.00 $13.50
Size 1A &1 Blend $16.00 $15.25 NO BID $18.00 $16.00 $14.50
Size 3 0r4 $14.00 $13.75 $10.00 $16.80 $14.00 $13.50
Crushed Limestone
T 2 . . 6.50 . . >
or Crushed Gravel: L %9:75 ¥7-75 y 025 %9:75 $8.35
Type 2A $10.75 $8.70 $6.50 $11.00 $10.75 $9.25
Type 3 $9.75 $7.50 $6.50 $10.00 $9.75 $8.25
Type 3JC $9.75 $7.50 NO BID $10.00 $9.25 $8.25

COMMENTS:

ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING,

SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS. THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION

OF BID RESULTS UNLESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

THIS BID TABULATIO

NwD’OES NOT IMPLY AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED.

/

—

/

//l '

PURCHASING DEPT




BID #2023H-1

STONE, SAND, GRAVEL AND TOPSOIL, CRUSHED STONE GRAVEL
BID TABULATION

2023-2025 BID PRICING

PART Il SNOW
R G KING
ANDIICE ARSENAL BARRETT Gragock HEIDELBURG VESPA SAND GENERAL
ASEED A e FRHG Lfc MATERIALS & STONE |CONSTRUCTION
WASHED SAND STONE MATERAL NRTHEAST A INC
ITEM
Snow & Ice $12.50 @
Abrasive $15.00 NO BID NO BID $18.30 $15.00 QUARRY
Washed Sand NO BD NO BID NO BDD NO BID NO BID NO BID
COMMENTS -

ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING,

SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS. THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION

OF BID RESULTS UNLESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

THIS BID T@BULA:[I»@N DOES NOT IMPLY AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED.
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3/15/2023

PURCHASING

DEPT

DATE




